€ Jown Deere

Quote Id: 32240758

Prepared For:

Melanie Earle
PANOLA COUNTY ROAD AND BRIDGE

Prepared By: Micah Pettit

United Ag & Turf
520 Highway 79 South
Henderson, TX 75654

Tel: 903-657-9549
Fax: 903-655-0478
Email: micahpettit@unitedagt.com

Date: 21 January 2025 Offer Expires: 28 January 2025

Confidential



@ JOHN DEERE

Quote Summary

Prepared For: Prepared By:
Melanie Earle Micah Pettit
PANOLA COUNTY ROAD AND BRIDGE United Ag & Turf
Melanie Earle 520 Highway 79 South
1121 E SABINE ST Henderson, TX 75654
CARTHAGE, TX 75633 Phone: 903-857-9549
Business: 903-693-3763 micahpettit@unitedagt.com
MELANIE.EARLE@CO.PANOLA.TX.US

Sourcewell Member #93202 Quote Id: 32240758
Ma.ke Payment to: Created On: 21 January 2025
United Ag and Turf

Last Modified On: 26 January 2025

7736 Central Park Dr Expiration Date: 28 January 2025

Waco TX 76712

Sourcewell Contract #070821-AGl
Discount is greater than the Sourcewell
contract of 15% from List

Equipment Summary Suggested List Selling Price Qty Extended
ALAMO Samurai 6110M w/Nokian $ 256,954.02 $ 208,335.00 X 1 = $ 208,335.00
tires
Equipment Total $ 208,335.00
Trade In Summary Qty Each Extended
2013 JOHN DEERE 6105D - 1 $ 20,000.00 $ 20,000.00
1P06105DVDM0511089
PayOff $0.00
Total Trade Allowance $ 20,000.00
Trade In Total $ 20,000.00
Quote Summary
Equipment Total $ 208,335.00
Trade In $ (20,000.00)
SubTotal $ 188,335.00
Total $ 188,335.00
Down Payment (0.00)
Rental Applied {0.00)
Balance Due $ 188,335.00

Salesperson : X Accepted By W i ﬂ(ﬂ




JOHN DEERE

Quote Id: 32240758

Selling Equipment

Customer: PANOLA COUNTY ROAD AND BRIDGE

ALAMO Samurai 6110M w/Nokian tires

Total Selling Price

Equipment Notes: Suggested List
$ 256,954.02
Hours: 0 Selling Price
Stock Number: $ 208,335.00
Code Description Qty Unit Extended
04852208  22Ft Samurai Boom 1 $63,811.00 $ 63,811.00
' Dealer Attachments ]
02986213SJ 50" Rotary Cutting Head, Blade Bar, 1 $22,325.00 $ 22,325.00
Swivel, J-Stk
02985029  Factory Mounting 1 $10,832.00 $ 10,832.00
Freight Factory Freight 1 $2,052.02 $2,052.02
32121141  6110M John Deere with Nokian Tires 1 $ 156,934.00 $ 156,934.00
Setup Setup 1 $ 1,000.00 $ 1,000.00
Dealer Attachments Total $ 193,143.02
Suggested Price $ 256,954.02
Customer Discounts . - -
Customer Discounts Total $ -48,619.02 $ -48,619.02

" $ 208,335.00
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Melanie Earle
m

From: Jed Klein <Jed Klein@sourcewell-mn.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, January 22, 2025 12:33 PM
To: Melanie Earle

Subject: RE: Quote

You will receive a new one of these from Micah.

Discount is accurate, contract # is correct, and as soon as Micah ads the Panola County Sourcewell membership
number...this should be good to go.

Thanks for using Sourcewell for your purchasing needs.

Jed Klein | Principal Supplier Development Executive

e: 218-895-4169 218-232-5643
ite: www.sourcewell-mn.gov

Sourcewell Ta

From: Melanie Earle <melanie.earle@co.panola.tx.us>
Sent: Wednesday, January 22, 2025 11:54 AM

To: Jed Klein <Jed.Klein@sourcewell-mn.gov>
Subject: FW: Quote

Revised quote

From: Micah Pettit <MicahPettit@unitedagt.com>
Sent: Wednesday, January 22, 2025 11:48 AM

To: Melanie Earle <melanie.carle@co.panola.tx.us>
Subject: RE: Quote

Melanie
Please see the revised Quote

Micah Pettit

United Ag & Turf - Account Manager
Cell: 903-658»4255

INITED | @

iy DE Efee



From: Melanie Earle <melanie earle@co.panola.tx.us>
Sent: Tuesday, January 21, 2025 3:32 PM

To: Micah Pettit <MicahPettit@unitedagt.com>
Subject: FW: Quote

NOTICE: THIS EMAIL IS FROM AN EXTERNAL SOURCE. DO NOT OPEN ATTACHMENTS OR CLICK ON LINKS FROM UNKNOWN SENDERS OR UNEXPECTED E-MAIL.

From: Jed Klein <Jed Klein@sourcewell-mn. gov>
Sent: Wednesday, January 15, 2025 3:54 PM

To: Melanie Earle <melanie earle@co.panola.tx.us>
Subject: FW: Quote

Melanie,

Yes, the discount for this unit should be 15%. Nathan M. from AGTX has contacted this dealer, and they will be sending
out a revised quote to you very soon.
Let me know when you have received this new quote please.

Thanks for using Sourcewell for your purchasing needs.
Have a great day.
Jed Klein | Principal Supplier Development Executive

Jffice: 218-895-4169 | Cell: 218-232-5643
Nebsite: www.sourcewell-mn.gov

Sourcewell g

From: Scott Carr <Scott.Carr@sourcewell-mn.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, January 15, 2025 12:47 PM

To: Jed Klein <Jed.Klein@sourcewell-mn.gov>
Subject: FW: Quote

Hey Jed,

Hope you are well and holidays treated you good! Attached is a quote that is for an Alamo solution. | will let you
facilitate verifying compliance with supplier. If you can respond back to Melanie direct that would be great.

Thanks Jed,

Scott Carr | Director of Cooperative Contracts
Grounds, Facilities, Park, Rec, Athletics
Cell: 320-493-7060



sourcewell-mn.gov

Sourcewell “a

From: Melanie Earle <melanie.earle @co.panola.tx.us>
Sent: Tuesday, January 14, 2025 8:11 AM

To: Scott Carr <Scott.Carr@sourcewell-mn.gov>
Subject: Quote

I'have attached a quote from United Ag & Turf (John Deere) can you please let me know if the price is in
compliance?

Thanks,

Melanie Earle

Panola County Road and Bridge Dept.
Road and Bridge Warehouse Coordinator
1121 East Sabine

Carthage, TX 75633

Office: (903) 693-3763

Fax: (903) 693-5368

CONFIDENTIALITY. This electronic mail and any files transmitted with it may contain information
proprietary to United Ag & Turf, or one of its affiliates, and are intended solely for the use of the individual
or entity to whom they are addressed, shall be maintained in confidence and not disclosed, or sent to,
third parties without the written consent of the sender. If you are not the intended recipient or the person
responsible for delivering the electronic mail to the intended recipient, be advised that you have received
this electronic mail in error and that any use, dissemination, forwarding, printing, referencing, publishing,
or copying of this electronic mail is strictly prohibited. If you have received this electronic mail in error,
please immediately notify the sender by return electronic mail.

CONFIDENTIALITY. This electronic mail and any files transmitted with it may contain information
proprietary to United Ag & Turf, or one of its affiliates, and are intended solely for the use of the individual
or entity to whom they are addressed, shall be maintained in confidence and not disclosed, or sent to,
third parties without the written consent of the sender. If you are not the intended recipient or the person
responsible for delivering the electronic mail to the intended recipient, be advised that you have received
this electronic mail in error and that any use, dissemination, forwarding, printing, referencing, publishing,
or copying of this electronic mail is strictly prohibited. If you have received this electronic mail in error,
please immediately notify the sender by return electronic mail.



